AUTHORIZATION TO AWARD LANDSCAPE MAINTENANCE SERVICES

RECOMMENDATION

The City Council authorize the Award of bid submitted for Landscape
Maintenance Services ~ City wide (IFB #07-07-08) to Country Bills Lawn
Maintenance inc, in the amount of $179,070 annually.

BACKGROUND

Landscape Maintenance Services have been outsourced by the City for in
excess of 20+ years as a full maintenance item. This year in order to save some
funding, the Purchasing Department put out a solicitation to offer us prices on 2
different options to handle the landscaping. We researched prices for the
following: Option #1: “Cut/Blow” or for Option #2: ‘Full service Maintenance”
which includes (weeding, edging, pruning, trimming, fertilizing, pest control and
more)...

After extensive research we have found that Option #1 “Cut/Blow” will better suit
the City's needs at this time and we will handle the additional maintenance
(weeding, edging, pruning, trimming, fertilizing, pest control and more) in house.

This is a fiv'e (5) year contract with five (5) one-year renewal options. After the
initial five (5) year coniract period, Purchasing will come back to the Council for
approval of each additional renewal period if we choose to exercise that right at
the given time. Prices bid shall be fixed and firm for the initial five (5) year
term of the contract. Contract is always subject to approved funding each year.

An Invitation for Bid (IFB) was issued and advertised on 1/18/08 (IFB # 07-07-
08). Four hundred and forty-four vendors were notified and twenty-nine IFB
packages were requested and issued. The [FB's were publicly opened on
February 12, 2008 with eleven (11) bids being received. Of the eleven (11) bids
received, four (4) of them were non-responsive.

It is respectfully requested the City Council authorize the award of bid, Option #1
“Cut/Blow” for Landscape Maintenance Services ~ City wide to Country Bills
Lawn Maintenance Inc.

Rgspggff%iiy supmitted, , ~
ANz vikeetza (S0
Dabbie Falestra, CPPO, ¢PPR
Purchasing Director
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City of North Miami

IFB # 07-07-08
Lands_cape Malntenan_ce Sevices - Citywide Think Green Lawn Care Valley CTeSt Landscape Fresh Cu_tt Lawn Ponderosa Landscaping Ground Keepers EDJ Service, Inc. E & S Landsc
Opening: 2/12/08 @ 3:00PM Miami, FL Maintenance Service Plantation, FL Miami Lakes, FL Plantation, FL Miar
Tabulated by: llyse S. Valdivia, Buyer ' Miami, FL Miami, FL ' ! '

ITEM / LOCATION [um] QTY |MOW & BIowlAII Inclusive | | Mow & BIOW|AII Inclusive | Mow & BIoﬂAII Inclusivel | Mow & Blow |AII Inclusive | | Mow & BIow|AII Inclusive | |M0w & BIowlAII Inclusive | | Mow & Blowl

West
Oleander Park and Swale Area |EA 1,800.00 2,500.00 2,190.00 9,480.00 10,500.00 9,000.00 6,000.00 3,750.00 6,000.00 2,700.00 2,868.90 6,000.00
NW 119 St. Mdns ea 1,800.00 2,500.00 930.00 27,180.00 2,250.00 1,500.00 750.00 5,250.00 2,700.00 5,227.50 6,000.00
1-95 Underpasses & Swale
Areas ea 5,000.00 6,000.00 5,580.00 9,210.00 2,580.00 1,380.00 4,500.00 6,000.00 14,175.00 26,265.00 8,250.00
North Miami Information Sign |ea 100.00 9,090.00 2,250.00 300.00 382.50
NW 127 St. Mdns ea 5,000.00 8,000.00 20,160.00 43,260.00 750.00 3,000.00 1,500.00 6,000.00 7,500.00 5,400.00 8,160.00 7,500.00
NW 11 Ave. Medians ea 2,000.00 3,000.00 9,360.00 13,260.00 600.00 3,000.00 1,500.00 4,800.00 6,000.00 2,700.00 3,442.50 7,500.00
NW 7 Ave. Landscape Islands |ea 1,000.00 5,670.00 2,250.00 4,500.00 2,430.00
NW 7 Ave. Landscape Islands |ea 2,000.00 12,300.00 1,500.00 3,600.00 3,442.50
NW 119 St. Street Closures ea 800.00 15,960.00 1,500.00 1,800.00 2,868.90
NW 6 Ave. Swale (West side) Jea 1,000.00 2,000.00 20,460.00 42,930.00 1,650.00 1,500.00 2,100.00 3,000.00 8,100.00 11,283.90 7,500.00
Overbrook Tot-Lot & Swale ea 1,000.00 2,000.00 4,680.00 6,840.00 3,150.00 2,250.00 1,200.00 1,350.00 810.00 1,147.50 3,600.00
NW 17 Ave. St. Closures ea 1,000.00 2,000.00 5,040.00 27,120.00 750.00 3,750.00 2,250.00 3,000.00 3,900.00 6,075.00 7,650.00 4,500.00
N. W. 125 Street ea 1,500.00 2,500.00 20,160.00 32,250.00 2,400.00 1,200.00 3,600.00 4,500.00 6,075.00 10,455.00 6,000.00
Ben Franklin Park Swale ea 1,000.00 8,760.00 NO BID 3,600.00 2,868.90
SUBTOTAL - WEST :] $20,100.00] $35,400.00] | $88,560.00| $263,310.00| | $0.00] | $30,780.00] $26,580.00] | $29,700.00| $57,300.00| | $48,735.00] $88,493.10] | $56,850.00|
Central

Griffing Blvd. Medians ea 1,500.00 3,500.00 20,160.00 38,010.00 6,000.00 7,500.00 4,050.00 4,972.50 7,500.00
Griffing Park ea 1,000.00 2,500.00 7,200.00 11,280.00 6,600.00 8,400.00 1,350.00 1,466.40 6,000.00
Griffing Senior Center ea 3,500.00 4,500.00 15,840.00 25,140.00 4,500.00 5,400.00 2,025.00 3,442.50 3,000.00
NE 127 St. Medians ea 750.00 1,500.00 2,880.00 3,660.00 840.00 1,350.00 675.00 1,721.40 1,500.00
NE 129 St. Medians ea 1,500.00 2,500.00 5,040.00 6,210.00 900.00 1,500.00 2,700.00 3,378.90 3,000.00
NE 4 Ave. Medians ea 2,500.00 3,500.00 9,360.00 10,710.00 7,500.00 9,000.00 2,700.00 4,016.40 4,500.00
NE 3 Ave. Courtyards ea 3,000.00 4,000.00 13,680.00 16,410.00 3,000.00 3,900.00 2,700.00 2,996.40 2,250.00
NE 5 Ave. Courtyards ea 4,000.00 5,000.00 18,000.00 23,250.00 6,000.00 7,500.00 3,375.00 3,825.00 4,500.00
West Dixie Hwy ea 7,000.00 9,000.00 22,320.00 25,590.00 20,400.00 24,000.00 10,800.00 15,363.90 9,000.00
City Hall, MoCA, North Miami,
Police Station Complex ea 3,000.00 4,000.00 18,000.00 27,000.00 10,800.00 13,800.00 2,700.00 3,825.00 9,000.00
NE 8 Ave. ea 1,500.00 2,500.00 13,680.00 16,050.00 2,250.00 3,000.00 1,350.00 1,338.90 3,900.00
NE 7 Ave. Courtyards ea 1,500.00 2,500.00 10,530.00 11,400.00 2,400.00 2,700.00 1,350.00 1,275.00 2,250.00
Downtown & Vicinity
Redevelopment ea 6,000.00 23,310.00 7,500.00 3,761.40
NE 125 St., Planter Boxes ea 10,000.00 14,880.00 1,500.00 3,697.50
Downtown Parking Lots ea 9,000.00| 11,000.00 20,160.00 21,480.00 6,000.00 7,500.00 2,700.00 3,761.40 4,500.00
Curbed Planter ea 4,000.00 5,000.00 2,880.00 3,480.00 750.00 1,050.00 450.00 637.50 1,200.00




caping Service Trolr_);cneéllsi\;eri?]reen LaBella Landscaping G & G Landscaping Country Bill's Lawn Maintenance
ni, FL . ping North Miami, FL Miami, FL North Miami, FL
Hialeah, FL
|AII Inclusive | |Mow & BIOW|AII Inclusive | Mow & Blow iAII Inclusive Mow & BIowiAII Inclusive Mow & Blow iAII Inclusive
7,650.00 4,500.00 6,810.00 3,750.00 4,500.00 3,600.00 4,500.00 4,200.00 5,880.00
9,000.00 3,300.00 4,410.00 6,000.00 9,750.00 4,500.00 9,000.00 1,200.00 1,680.00
10,950.00 3,300.00 4,410.00 12,750.00 16,500.00 15,000.00 18,000.00 8,100.00 11,340.00
750.00 2,010.00 1,500.00 1,800.00 600.00
12,000.00 3,750.00 4,500.00 9,000.00 11,250.00 7,500.00 10,500.00 4,800.00 6,720.00
9,600.00 3,900.00 4,950.00 5,250.00 6,750.00 4,500.00 6,750.00 2,100.00 2,940.00
4,350.00 4,050.00 3,000.00 2,400.00 1,800.00
5,250.00 2,850.00 7,800.00 6,000.00 2,700.00
5,850.00 2,700.00 7,500.00 6,000.00 7,500.00
9,600.00 3,600.00 4,500.00 7,500.00 15,000.00 9,000.00 18,000.00 1,500.00 1,950.00
5,250.00 3,600.00 4,410.00 2,250.00 4,500.00 2,250.00 3,750.00 900.00 1,170.00
7,149.90 4,350.00 6,600.00 9,000.00 15,000.00 12,000.00 15,000.00 4,200.00 5,460.00
8,850.00 4,800.00 7,200.00 9,000.00 18,000.00 9,000.00 15,000.00 1,800.00 2,340.00
5,250.00 3,000.00 4,500.00 6,000.00 1,440.00
| $101,499.90| | $35,100.00| $62,400.00| $64,500.00] $125,550.00 $67,350.00] $122,700.00 $28,800.00] $53,520.00
12,000.00]| [no bid this section 18,000.00 24,000.00 15,000.00 21,000.00 2,400.00 3,120.00
9,000.00 10,500.00 15,000.00 10,500.00 13,500.00 2,700.00 3,510.00
5,250.00 6,000.00 12,000.00 7,500.00 11,250.00 1,500.00 1,950.00
3,000.00 3,750.00 5,250.00 3,000.00 4,500.00 750.00 1,050.00
6,750.00 7,500.00 12,000.00 6,000.00 9,000.00 1,500.00 1,950.00
6,750.00 15,000.00 19,500.00 12,000.00 18,000.00 2,100.00 2,730.00
3,600.00 15,000.00 13,500.00 9,000.00 13,500.00 2,100.00 2,730.00
6,600.00 19,500.00 24,000.00 18,000.00 24,000.00 3,600.00 4,680.00
14,700.00 27,000.00 42,000.00 24,000.00 36,000.00 7,500.00 9,750.00
12,750.00 22,500.00 30,000.00 21,000.00 27,000.00 6,000.00 7,800.00
6,000.00 7,500.00 12,000.00 7,500.00 12,000.00 900.00 1,170.00
3,300.00 6,000.00 7,500.00 4,500.00 6,000.00 1,500.00 1,950.00
9,000.00 10,500.00 12,000.00 5,850.00
21,000.00 6,000.00 6,000.00 4,500.00
7,500.00 12,000.00 19,500.00 13,500.00 21,000.00 2,400.00 3,120.00
2,250.00 1,200.00 1,500.00 1,200.00 1,800.00 300.00 450.00




Traffic Circle ea 3,000.00 3,600.00 600.00 522.90
Library Swale & Parking Lot |ea 3,000.00 4,000.00 13,680.00 15,660.00 3,600.00 6,000.00 2,025.00 2,422.50 4,500.00
West Dixie Hwy. Landscaping |ea 3,000.00 4,000.00 9,360.00 11,220.00 600.00 900.00 1,944.00 2,040.00 3,300.00
N. E. 6™ Ave ea 4,000.00 22,470.00 12,000.00 8,797.50
Parking Lot ea 1,000.00 2,000.00 5,040.00 6,600.00 2,250.00 3,900.00 540.00 816.00 1,800.00
West Dixie Highway ea 3,000.00 4,000.00 11,520.00 12,930.00 12,000.00| 15,000.00 5,400.00 6,885.00 4,500.00
Breezeswept Park & Prk. Lot |ea 3,000.00 4,000.00 7,200.00 7,890.00 1,350.00 1,800.00 810.00 752.40 1,500.00
Chamber of Commerce ea 3,000.00 4,000.00 5,040.00 5,730.00 1,500.00 1,950.00 540.00 637.50 2,250.00
Monument ea 2,000.00 3,000.00 2,880.00 3,030.00 1,050.00 1,350.00 540.00 522.90 900.00
Bridge ea 2,000.00 3,000.00 7,200.00 7,500.00 1,200.00 1,500.00 810.00 752.40 1,500.00
Walkway ea 2,000.00 3,000.00 2,880.00 3,450.00 1,500.00 1,200.00 450.00 405.00 2,250.00
Triangle ea 2,000.00 3,000.00 5,040.00 7,050.00 1,200.00 1,500.00 540.00 486.00 1,200.00

SUBTOTAL - CENTRAL:] 67,750.00] $118,000.00] |$249,570.00] $384,990.00] | $104,190.00] $153,300.00] | $52,524.00] $84,520.20] | $85,800.00]

EAST
Parks Operation Center Swale |ea 9,360.00 10,560.00 1,050.00 1,200.00 810.00 752.40 2,250.00
NE 14 Ave. Mdns. ea 7,200.00 9,750.00 1,800.00 2,100.00 810.00 1,275.00 3,600.00
NE 14 Ave. Swale at 125 St.  |o5 9,360.00 11,130.00 1,800.00 2,100.00 540.00 459.00 3,000.00
Arch Creek Road Swale & NE
125 St ea 2,880.00 4,590.00 36,000.00] 39,000.00 810.00 729.00 4,200.00
Gwen Margolis Community
Center (GMCC) ea 11,520.00 14,880.00 1,800.00 2,250.00 2,250.00 3,633.90 4,800.00
Emerald Dr. Cul-de-Sac ca 5,040.00 5,400.00 750.00  1,050.00 450.00 450.00 1,350.00
Emerald Dr. Landscaping &
South Swale ea 7,200.00 9,270.00 9,000.00]  10,500.00 675.00 816.00 4,200.00
Emerald Dr. North Swale ea 2,250.00 3,750.00 9,000.00] 10,500.00 810.00 1,147.50 2,850.00
3 Traffic Islands on Arch Creek
Rd ea 900.00 1,800.00 900.00 1,050.00 540.00 637.50 2,400.00
Jaycee Park & Swale ea 750.00 900.00 1,050.00 1,350.00 540.00 480.00 2,250.00
NE 142 St. Vacant Lot & Swale
ea 750.00 900.00 1,050.00 1,050.00 540.00 480.00 2,250.00

Motor Pool at 1855 NE 143
St. & Surrounding Swale Areas |ea 4,500.00 7,200.00 6,000.00 6,000.00 1,350.00 1,215.00 2,550.00
NE 18 Ave. Swale & Sidewalk lea 1,500.00 1,710.00 6,000.00 9,000.00 675.00 607.50 2,550.00
Enchanted Forest Park ea 4,500.00 1,500.00 9,435.00
Traffic Circle Biscayne Blvd.
Medians ea 4,500.00 7,500.00 4,500.00 5,250.00 4,050.00 8,032.50 6,000.00
Biscayne Blvd. Sidewalks
& Cutouts, & all bricked
sidewalks. ea 5,610.00 15,000.00 3,570.00
4 Grass Swale Areas on
Biscayne Blvd. ea 1,200.00 1,350.00 3,750.00 4,500.00 810.00 729.00 1,350.00
Alley Closure ea 1,500.00 240.00 450.00




1,200.00 1,200.00 1,500.00 900.00
9,750.00 12,000.00 24,000.00 15,000.00 24,000.00 3,600.00 4,680.00
4,950.00 7,500.00 10,500.00 7,500.00 12,000.00 1,800.00 2,340.00
10,500.00 15,000.00 18,000.00 9,750.00
3,600.00 3,000.00 6,000.00 3,000.00 7,500.00 750.00 1,050.00
8,250.00 10,500.00 13,500.00 10,500.00 13,500.00 1,800.00 2,340.00
3,300.00 6,000.00 9,000.00 4,500.00 7,500.00 1,500.00
3,300.00 3,000.00 5,250.00 3,000.00 5,250.00 1,500.00
2,550.00 1,500.00 2,250.00 1,500.00 2,250.00 750.00
2,550.00 2,250.00 3,750.00 3,000.00 4,500.00 750.00
2,850.00 1,500.00 2,250.00 2,250.00 3,000.00 750.00
2,250.00 1,500.00 2,250.00 1,500.00 2,250.00 750.00
$184,500.00 [no bid | 220,200.00] $349,200.00] | $204,450.00] $337,800.00 $49,200.00] $77,370.00
3,000.00] [no bid this section no bid this section no bid this section 750.00 1,050.00
4,800.00 900.00 1,170.00
4,500.00 600.00 900.00
5,100.00 600.00 900.00
5,700.00 3,000.00 3,900.00
3,600.00 600.00 900.00
5,250.00 750.00 1,050.00
4,500.00 900.00 1,170.00
4,200.00 750.00 1,050.00
4,500.00 750.00 1,050.00
4,500.00 750.00 1,050.00
4,500.00 900.00 1,170.00
3,600.00 900.00 1,170.00
6,000.00 3,000.00
14,100.00 6,000.00 7,800.00
2,550.00 2,250.00
2,850.00 900.00 1,170.00
1,350.00 1,200.00




Alley Closure ea 1,200.00 240.00 450.00
Curbed Planter ea 1,800.00 240.00 375.00
Curbed Planter ea 1,800.00 240.00 435.00
Curbed Planter ea 1,800.00 240.00 435.00
Curbed Planter ea 4,020.00 240.00 573.90
Curbed Planters ea 2,100.00 240.00 637.50
Curbed Planters ea 2,100.00 240.00 537.90
Enchanted Forest ea 7,200.00 240.00 9,180.00
NE 135 St. Medians ea 18,000.00 28,470.00 39,000.00 42,000.00 6,075.00 7,841.40 7,500.00
NE 135 St. North Swale ea 5,040.00 6,090.00 4,500.00 6,000.00 2,025.00 1,976.40 1,500.00
NE 143 St. Medians ea 4,680.00 450.00 650.40

SANS SOUCI
East of Biscayne Blvd. — 2
Medians ea 3,750.00 6,240.00 9,000.00 10,500.00 8,100.00 8,415.00 9,000.00
Sans Souci Tennis Center
(S.S8.T.C)) ea 6,000.00 16,260.00 9,000.00 10,500.00 5,400.00 8,096.40 6,000.00
Guardhouse ea 750.00 900.00 1,350.00 1,650.00 450.00 615.00 2,400.00
5 Canal Ends on Canal Dr. 3,000.00 6,960.00 600.00 750.00 2,025.00 2,025.00 4,500.00
Street Closure ea 900.00 600.00 459.00
Street Closure ea 900.00 600.00 480.00
Street Closure ea 900.00 600.00 401.70
Street Closure ea 1,500.00 600.00 541.80
Traffic Circles 1,800.00 3,420.00 450.00 600.00 2,025.00 2,040.00 2,400.00
North Swale of Canal Dr ea 4,500.00 23,580.00 9,000.00 10,500.00 6,075.00 7,650.00 1,800.00
North Bayshore Park & Swale |ea 4,500.00 7,650.00 9,000.00 10,500.00 3,375.00 3,825.00 7,500.00
KEYSTONE
Bridge #1 ea 1,500.00 1,350.00 879.90
Traffic Triangle ea 750.00 2,400.00 900.00 1,200.00 300.00 716.40 1,200.00
Traffic Triangle ea 1,650.00 1,350.00 637.50
Traffic Triangle ea 2,400.00 1,050.00 816.00
Traffic Triangle ea 1,650.00 1,050.00 752.40
Canal Ends ea 1,800.00 4,050.00 450.00 600.00 675.00 605.70 1,350.00
Canal Ends ea 2,250.00 5,550.00 450.00 600.00 1,950.00 1,721.40 3,600.00
Canal Ends ea 2,250.00 5,550.00 300.00 450.00 810.00 720.30 2,400.00
Canal Ends ea 900.00 1,950.00 450.00 600.00 540.00 486.00 1,200.00
Canal Ends ea 2,700.00 6,750.00 450.00 600.00 2,025.00 1,785.00 1,200.00
Traffic Circle ea 150.00 240.00 382.50
Traffic Circle ea 150.00 240.00 382.50
Traffic Circle ea 150.00 240.00 382.50
Traffic Circle ea 150.00 240.00 382.50
Traffic Circle ea 900.00 240.00 382.50
Traffic Circle ea 450.00 240.00 382.50




1,500.00 1,200.00
1,650.00 1,200.00
1,650.00 1,200.00
1,650.00 1,200.00
1,650.00 1,200.00
1,650.00 1,200.00
1,650.00 1,200.00
3,000.00 1,950.00
9,750.00 10,500.00 13,650.00
2,550.00 750.00 1,050.00
3,600.00 1,500.00
11,250.00( |no bid this section no bid this section no bid this section 4,950.00 6,450.00
8,250.00 1,680.00 2,550.00
3,600.00 750.00 1,050.00
5,550.00 1,500.00 1,950.00
1,350.00 1,050.00
1,350.00 1,050.00
1,350.00 1,050.00
1,350.00 1,050.00
3,600.00 750.00 1,050.00
2,550.00 2,250.00 3,000.00
11,250.00 1,800.00 2,100.00
2,550.00] [no bid this section no bid this section no bid this section 750.00
1,950.00 750.00 1,050.00
1,950.00 1,050.00
1,950.00 1,050.00
1,950.00 1,050.00
2,550.00 900.00 1,350.00
4,200.00 1,800.00 2,280.00
3,600.00 900.00 1,200.00
1,950.00 750.00 1,050.00
1,950.00 1,800.00 2,550.00
1,350.00 1,050.00
1,350.00 1,050.00
1,350.00 1,050.00
1,350.00 1,050.00
1,350.00 1,050.00
1,350.00 1,050.00




Traffic Circle ea 150.00 240.00 382.50
Traffic Circle ea 150.00 240.00 382.50
Traffic Circle ea 300.00 240.00 382.50
Traffic Circle ea 150.00 240.00 382.50
Traffic Circle ea 1,500.00 1,800.00 300.00 540.00 210.00 510.00 1,200.00
Traffic Circle ea 750.00 1,800.00 300.00 540.00 210.00 382.50 1,200.00
Traffic Circle ea 150.00 240.00 382.50
Street Closure ea 1,650.00 450.00 274.50
Keystone Entrance ea 2,250.00 6,300.00 1,500.00 1,950.00 810.00 1,976.40 4,500.00
Guardhouse ea 450.00 600.00 150.00 240.00 450.00 382.50 1,500.00
Guardhouse ea 450.00 600.00 150.00 240.00 540.00 522.90 1,500.00
Guardhouse ea 450.00 600.00 150.00 240.00 540.00 522.90 1,500.00
Keystone Tot-Lot & Field ea 3,000.00 5,250.00 3,000.00 3,600.00 1,350.00 2,103.90 2,700.00
Besade Park ea 4,500.00 25,050.00 5,250.00 6,750.00 1,350.00 3,251.40 2,700.00
SUBTOTAL - EAST:[NOBID  |[NOBID | [$140,250.00] $312,720.00] INO BID | [$180,150.00] $237,450.00] | $62,970.00] $115,795.80] | $115,950.00|
ADDT'L GRASS-ONLY AREAS|
North Miami Tot-Lot Swale ea 1,500.00 900.00 495.00
Kiwanis Park & Swale ea 1,500.00 4,500.00 2,970.00
Pepper Park Fields (total of 78
cuts) ea 13,650.00 31,200.00 15,600.00
Pepper Park Swale, Parking
Lots & Common Areas
Between Fields 4,500.00 12,000.00 7,755.00
Sasso Pool & Swale ea 6,000.00 6,000.00 2,970.00
Sunkist Grove Community
Center & Swale ea 5,250.00 4,500.00 2,970.00
Pepper Park Inside ea 4,500.00 12,000.00 4,455.00
Breezeswept Park, Parking Lot
& PIntr ea 2,250.00 1,500.00 990.00
Enchanted Forest Park &
West Swale 18,000.00 10,500.00 8,910.00
Keystone Center, Swale &
Field ea 3,000.00 3,000.00 891.00
Besade Park ea 4,500.00 6,000.00 891.00
Stadium Field (total of 78 cuts)
ea 6,630.00 7,500.00 9,750.00
Stadium perimeter & Parking |ea 8,250.00 19,500.00 4,455.00
Ben Franklin Field & North
Swale (total of 78 cuts) ea 19,500.00 46,800.00 19,500.00
Parking Lot ea 750.00 1,200.00 594.00
Chamber of Commerce ea 900.00 900.00 660.00
Monument ea 750.00 1,050.00 495.00




1,350.00 1,050.00
1,350.00 1,050.00
1,350.00 1,050.00
1,350.00 1,050.00
1,950.00 750.00 1,050.00
1,950.00 750.00 1,050.00
1,350.00 1,050.00
1,350.00 1,050.00
6,600.00 1,200.00 1,800.00
2,250.00 300.00 600.00
2,250.00 300.00 600.00
2,250.00 300.00 600.00
4,500.00 1,500.00 1,950.00
4,500.00 1,500.00 1,950.00

$233,400.00 [no bid [nobid $57,480.00]  $116,430.00
no bid this section 1,500.00 1,500.00 750.00
4,500.00 5,250.00 4,320.00
46,800.00 42,900.00 13,182.00
15,000.00 18,000.00 2,250.00
7,500.00 6,000.00 1,200.00
6,000.00 5,250.00 1,200.00
3,000.00 3,000.00 1,500.00
6,000.00 4,500.00
19,500.00 22,500.00 5,190.00
7,500.00 7,500.00
6,000.00 6,000.00
23,400.00 23,400.00 11,388.00
12,000.00 15,000.00 1,500.00
27,300.00 23,400.00 13,182.00
3,000.00 2,250.00
3,000.00 3,000.00
1,500.00 1,500.00




Bridge ea 750.00 1,200.00 1,155.00
Walkway ea 750.00 3,000.00 330.00
Triangle ea 150.00 450.00 495.00
NW 125 Street ea 6,000.00 3,000.00 2,970.00
SUBTOTAL -ADDT'L GRASS AREAS:[NO BID  [NO BID | [$109,080.00] l $0.00] [ $176,700.00 | [ $89,301.00 | [nobid |
PUBLIC WORKS AREAS
NE 140 Street to NE 143
Street, East and West of West
Dixie Highway ea 750.00 1,500.00 no bid this section 240.00 300.00 862.50 862.50] |no bid this sec
NE 126 Street & 127 Street
strip between the service
station and Domino's Pizza on
West Dixie Highway ea 750.00 900.00 1,050.00 1,200.00 517.50 517.50
6 guardrails along West side of
1-95 from NW 120 Street to NW
134 Street ea 1,800.00 5,250.00 600.00 750.00 3,105.00 3,105.00
6 guardrails along Arch Creek
Road from NE 125 Street North
to 16 Avenue ea 2,700.00 3,150.00 3,000.00 3,750.00 1,207.50 1,207.50
Guardrail at NE 142 Street and
NE 20 Avenue ea 450.00 750.00 300.00 300.00 517.50 517.50
Swale areas South side of NE
139 Street from NE 11 Avenue
to West Dixie Highway EA 750.00 900.00 1,350.00 1,500.00 975.00 975.00
Grass areas in the public
parking lots NE 18 Avenue
from 143 Street to 146 Street |EA 1,500.00 1,950.00 900.00 1,050.00 690.00 690.00
Guardrail at NE 14 Avenue
from 125 Street to 126 Street |ea 750.00 900.00 750.00 1,050.00 759.00 759.00
Vacant lots behind Javan
Lumber between NW 7 Avenue
and 1-95 from 127 Street to 129
Street ea 2,250.00 2,850.00 3,000.00 4,500.00 1,725.00 1,725.00
Guardrails - 135 Street to NE
16 Avenue and NE 15 Avenue
to NE 125 Street ea 1,500.00 1,950.00 3,000.00 4,500.00 1,380.00 1,380.00
City parking - outside perimeter
- 4 corner stripes NE 18
Avenue and 144 Street ea 1,050.00 1,650.00 900.00 1,050.00 862.50 862.50




3,000.00 3,000.00
1,500.00 2,250.00
1,500.00 1,500.00
7,500.00 6,000.00
[no bid ] [ $207,000.00] $203,700.00] $55,662.00]
tion 900.00[  1,200.00 3,750.00 5,250.00 4,050.00 5,250.00 1,500.00 1,950.00
900.00|  1,200.00 1,500.00 2,250.00 1,800.00 2,250.00 750.00 1,050.00
900.00[  1,200.00 4,500.00 6,000.00 5,250.00 6,000.00 1,500.00 1,950.00
900.00|  1,200.00 6,000.00 7,500.00 6,000.00 7,500.00 1,500.00 1,950.00
600.00 600.00 750.00 1,050.00 750.00 1,500.00 600.00 900.00
1,350.00|  1,500.00 1,500.00 2,250.00 2,250.00 2,550.00 750.00 1,050.00
900.00|  1,200.00 4,500.00 6,000.00 5,250.00 6,000.00 1,500.00 1,950.00
750.00)  1,050.00 1,500.00 1,800.00 1,500.00 1,800.00 750.00 1,050.00
1,050.00|  1,350.00 2,250.00 3,750.00 3,000.00 3,750.00 1,500.00 1,950.00
1,200.00|  1,500.00 3,750.00 4,500.00 4,500.00 6,000.00 1,500.00 1,950.00
600.00 750.00 6,000.00 7,500.00 6,750.00 7,500.00 750.00 1,050.00




Swale area along the Keystone

wall (24 visits); from NE 124 St

North to Ixora Ln on the East

side of NE 18 Ave (total of 24

cuts) ea 1,800.00 3,450.00 2,400.00 2,880.00 2,484.00 2,484.00

Vacant lot across from Penny

Sugarman Tennis Courts ea 1,650.00 900.00 1,050.00 1,380.00 1,380.00

Outside and inside the Motor

pool Complex ea 4,500.00 7,200.00 6,000.00 600.00 3,795.00 3,795.00

LIFT STATION B: NW 136th

STREET & 2nd AVENUE ea 750.00 1,050.00 4,200.00 4,500.00 862.50 862.50

LIFT STATION E: NE 143rd  |ea

STREET & 12th AVENUE ea 900.00 1,050.00 4,200.00 4,500.00 1,207.50 1,207.50

LIFT STATION G: NE 143rd  |ea

STREET & 15th AVENUE ea 900.00 1,050.00 4,200.00 4,500.00 862.50 862.50

LIFT STATION H: NE 130th

STREET & 14th AVENUE ea 900.00 1,050.00 4,200.00 4,500.00 862.50 862.50

LIFT STATION I: NE 124th

STREET & 18th AVENUE ea 900.00 1,050.00 4,200.00 4,500.00 862.50 862.50

BREEZESWEPT: NE 127th

STREET & 2nd AVENUE ea | 2250 3000 | [ | ] [ | 1,500.00 1,800.00 759.00 1,035.00

SUBTOTAL -PUBLIC WORKS AREAS:[NOBID ~ |NO BID | | 27150.00] $42,300.00] l $0.00] | $46,890.00] $48,780.00] | $25,677.00] $25,953.00] [no bid
GRAND TOTALS: MOW & BLOW $87,850.00 $614,610.00 $950.00 $537,630.00 $279,207.00
ALL INCLUSIVE SERVICES: $153,400.00 $1,003,320.00 $0.00 $496,830.00 $314,762.10

Multiplier : 30 cuts per year/ line item= one year of cuts; except where specified: Pepper Park Fields, Stadium
Field, Ben Franklin Field & North Swale= 78 cuts per year/line item; Swale area along keystone wall: 24 visits per
year/line item. ALL BIDS ARE STILL UNDER REVIEW AND NO RECOMMENDATION HAS BEEN MADE THUS FAR.



1,200.00|  1,440.00 4,800.00 6,000.00 5,400.00 6,000.00 1,680.00 2,400.00

1,200.00|  1,500.00 3,000.00 4,500.00 2,250.00 3,000.00 750.00 1,050.00

1,200.00  1,500.00 6,750.00 8,250.00 7,500.00]  10,500.00 1,500.00 1,950.00

900.00|  1,200.00 2,250.00 3,000.00 2,250.00 3,000.00 1,050.00 1,500.00

900.00]  1,200.00 2,400.00 3,000.00 2,700.00 3,750.00 1,050.00 1,500.00

900.00]  1,200.00 2,250.00 3,000.00 2,400.00 3,000.00 1,050.00 1,500.00

750.00]  1,050.00 2,400.00 3,000.00 2,700.00 3,000.00 1,050.00 1,500.00

600.00 900.00 1,800.00 2,400.00 2,250.00 2,400.00 1,050.00 1,500.00

900 1200 2250.00 3000.00 2250.00 3000.00 1050.00 1500.00

|no bid | | $18,600.00] $23,940.00| $63,900.00]  $84,000.00] | $70,800.00] $87,750.00 $22,830.00]  $31,200.00
$258,600.00 $53,700.00 $555,600.00 $546,300.00 $213,972.00
$519,399.90 $86,340.00 $558,750.00 $548,250.00 $278,520.00
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